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TRUSTEES OF LOCAL CHARITIES – 2014/2015 
 
 
 
Colin Pond Bursaries for Higher Education 
 
The Colin Pond Bursaries for Higher Education provides students with bursaries to 
continue into higher education. 
 
The trustees are the Cabinet Member for Children's Services, the Chief Finance Officer, 
the Corporate Director of Children’s Services and the Head of Legal and Democratic 
Services 
 
 
 
Dagenham United Charity 
 
The Dagenham United Charity gives financial assistance to those in need at Christmas 
time and the area of benefit is the former Borough of Dagenham as at 1921 to 1924.   
 
There are five trustees, four of whom are appointed by the Council and may be, but do not 
need to be, elected Members of the Council.  They are elected for a four year term of 
office: 
 

Councillors                                                (June 2014-May 2018) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
King George V Silver Jubilee Trust Fund 
 
This applies the net income from investments for the purpose of relieving cases of need, 
hardship or distress of children resident in the area. 
 
The Council of the London Borough of Barking and subsequently Barking & Dagenham 
(being the successors to the said Urban District Council) appointed the Mayor, the 
Chairman of Social Services Committee (now the Lead Member for Children’s Services) 
and the Director of Social Services (now the Corporate Director of Children’s Services) to 
convene a meeting for the purpose of distribution. 
 
 
The trustees are the Mayor and the former Director of Social Services (now the 
Corporate Director of Children's Services).  There is no specific term of office.  
 
 

 
 



APPENDIX D 

June 2014 

The Kallar Lodge and Few LodgeTrust Fund (formerlyThe Brocklebank Lodge Trust 
Fund) 
 
This was established some years ago following a bequest to Brocklebank Lodge.   
Following approval by the Charity Commission in 2008 the Trust Fund was transferred to 
Lake Rise Residential Home, which is now known as Kallar Lodge, and the Trust Fund 
was renamed as The Kallar Lodge Trust Fund.  The Trust Fund provides extra amenity for 
Kallar Lodge, over and above that which is provided by the Council. 
 
The Trust usually meets once a year to approve the minutes, accounts and expenditure for 
the following year.  The trustees are the former Directors of Finance and Social Services 
(both to be replaced at the Trust’s Annual General Meeting) and two Member 
representatives who are nominated annually as follows: 
 

Councillor                            (June 2014 – May 2015) 
and Councillor                    (June 2014 - May 2015) 

 
 
 


